
*Labatt - New Mexico Resident Business Certeficate .5%

ITEM DESCRIPTION BRAND PRICE PER VENDOR

MONTHLY 

ESTIMATED 

CASES

1 Apple Juice 100% fruit 10 oz plastic bottles 24ct Growers Pride $15.04 Ben E. Keith 620009 20

2 Apple, Pie, Filling 6 #10 cans $35.02 Sysco 4015574 12

3 Apples, slices, Natural Juice, Grade B Choice 6 #10 cans $35.02 Sysco 4015657 12

4 Applesauce, Sweetened 6 #10 cans $35.02 Sysco 4015657 12

5 Bacon bits, imitation - 10# box Fairbury $23.43 Labatt 2919561 1

6 Bacon Topping Precooked 10# box Hertg $30.81 Labatt 1911338

7 Bacon, pre-cooked 300 ct. $15.18 Sysco 2145241 20

8 Bagel Breakfast with  Egg, bacon & cheese 96ct Tony's $68.41 Labatt 8907355 90

9 Baking powder, 10# cans, 4/cs $35.02 Sysco 4992681 1

10 BBQ Sauce Mesquite 4 - 1 gallon Little Pig $25.81 Labatt 3206117 6

11 BBQ Sauce Portion Control Dipping Cups 100CT per case Bullseye $11.00 Labatt 3200006 15

12 Beans Ranch Style 6 #10 cans $31.38 Sysco 5975123 24

13 Beans, Green Italian 6 #10 cans, US Grade B Libby $34.23 Labatt 1498518 24

14 Beans, green, 4 Sieve, Cut 1/4  6 #10 cans Stokely $32.45 Labatt 1447580 24

15 Beans, pinto, Vegetarian, Seasoned, US Grade B, 6 #10 cans $29.66 Sysco 79584 24

16 Beans, refried, dehydrated, 6/30 oz bags, US Grade A Cookquik $22.85 Labatt 2105556 24

17 Beef Bouillon Knorr 4 / 7.9 Lbs per case Knorr/nestle $35.02 Sysco 4944260 1

18 Beef Brisket, Packer Label USDA Choice grade per pound National $3.78 Ben E. Keith 500381 4

19 Beef char-broil patties, "Advance Pierre" 155-525-0, 90/2.5oz. advance/Pierre $31.38 Sysco 6510846 20

20 Beef Fajita, Strips, Fully Cooked 10 LBS case #7114-201 advance/Pierre $31.38 Sysco 8578809 25

21 Beef Patty, Breaded Fully Cooked CN label 40CT advance/Pierre $31.38 Sysco 6776942 45

22 Beef Ravioli in tomato sauce 6/10# can CN Label Chef Boyardee $35.02 Sysco 4824785 25

23 Beef Steak fingers, 495 / .97oz CN WG advance/Pierre $20.63 Sysco 3422433 32

24 Beef, ground, Fresh,  85% beef - 15% fat   8/10 lbs Packer $151.03 Labatt 8789257 10

25 Beef, Hamburger Patty 5oz Raw IQF 100% Beef 40ct $31.38 Sysco 8160103 5

26 Beef, Inside Round Denuded Angus / per pound $4.95 Ben E. Keith 154668 5

27 Boneless Breaded Chicken Wings Cooked 10 Lbs Case Red label Tyson $20.63 Sysco 3590076 10

28 Boneless Pit Ham pork leg by pound Hormel $3.37 Ben E. Keith 113769 6

29 Bottle Water 16.9 fl.oz - 24ct Purelife $4.78 Ben E. Keith 630142 300

30 Bread Garlic / Texas Thick 120ct / 1.31oz WG Bulk BakeCrafters $20.63 Sysco 3189656 15

31 Bread Yeast Dinner Roll 2oz Heat & Serve Shubert $25.49 Ben E. Keith 398575 40

32 Breakfast Biscuit Split, 120ct / 2oz $15.18 Sysco 2173393

33 Broccoli Cuts, 12 / 2 Lbs Bags IQF Expor $29.98 Labatt 9341013 14

34 Brownie Mix - 6/5 lbs $20.63 Sysco 2529543 4

35 Buffalo Wing Sauce Red Hot Original 4-1 Gallon Frank's $20.63 Sysco 3523537 2

36 Cake Mix, white, 6/5 lbs CMI $36.67 Labatt 4071108 4

37 Cake Mix, yellow, 6/5 lbs CMI $36.73 Labatt 4071110 4

38 California Blend vegetables,12-2 Lbs Bags IQF $20.63 Sysco 3831542 14

39 Canadian Ham, Sliced Round shape 5 / 2 Lbs case Hormel $52.77 Ben E. Keith 530968 22

40 Carrots, Sliced, Frozen, 12-2 Lbs Bags IQF $16.09 Sysco 1038660 12

41 Cheddar cheese sauce, mild 6/10# $15.18 Sysco 1940725 14

42 Cheddar Cheese Stick 1oz/ 168ct $20.63 Sysco 2818801 4

43 Cheese, American, Sliced, 6-160 $35.02 Sysco 513069 8

44 Cheese, Shredded, Cheddar/ Jack Mixed 4/5lbs bags $20.63 Sysco 2822338 8

45 Cheese, Sliced Pepper Jack, 8-1.5 Lbs $31.38 Sysco 6238303 4

46 Cheez-it  1 oz Whole Grain (24100-79482) 175ct Kellogg's $15.18 Sysco 2098269 14

47 Cherry Pie, Filling Sweet 6 #10 cans $20.63 Sysco 2637387 12

48 Chicken & Cheese Tamales 120ct 2oz #975LS  UPC 30078051049755 DSM Cook $75.44 Labatt 7040130 30

49 Chicken Drumstick Fully Cooked Breaded CN labeled Tyson $101.30 Labatt 9911023 35

50 Chicken Tangerine 6/2.15 Lbs Sauce & 6/5 Lbs Chicken Mfg. 72001 Asian solutions $20.63 Sysco 2819973 8

51 Chicken Wings 1&2 disjointed 5-8 IQF 4-10Lbs or 8- 5Lbs Agrosuper $31.38 Sysco 9556481 20

52 Chicken, Breast Fillet Whole Grain Hot 'N Spicy Code # 7517 Tyson $81.05 Labatt 9011076 15
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53 Chicken, Breast Fillet Whole Grain Regular Code #7516 Goldkist Farms $20.63 Sysco 3151463 15

54 Chicken, cooked, diced 1/2", Dark and White meat 10 Lbs Case Tyson $31.38 Sysco 6147193 32

55 Chicken, Fajita Southwestern with Grilled Marks Mfg. 60404-571 Goldkist Farms $16.09 Sysco 845410 32

56 Chicken, Fully Cooked, Mesquite glazed, breast, tight, drumstick 96-2oz M/MA Goldkist Farms $20.63 Sysco 2446300 20

57 Chicken, Pattie, Grilled Marked, CN Labeled 156-3 oz Goldkist Farms $31.38 Sysco 6459586 12

58 Chicken, Tenderloin,  Breaded  Cooked CN labeled Tyson $94.16 Ben E. Keith 101046 20

59 Chile, green, frozen, diced 6/5 lbs  (Hot and Mild) M.A & Sons $16.24 Sysco 1371822 6

60 Chili hot dog sauce with meat "no beans" 6 #10 can, low sodium chef mate $35.02 Sysco 4053419 6

61 Chili powder Red & Green ground, 5#, mild&hot $31.38 Sysco 7817299 1

62 Chili, red, frozen, puree mild/hot 6/5 lbs. tub (Hot and Mild) M.A & Sons $16.24 Sysco 1471242 4

63 Chipotle Base 6-14.4 oz minors $31.38 Sysco 8410953 1

64 Chips, nacho, bulk pack round chips - 6 / 2Lbs box Gran Sabor $18.18 Ben E. Keith 106060 12

65 Cinnamon, 1 lb jars - PURE ground Tex Spice $6.60 Labatt 6181176 1

66 Claude's Marinating Brisket Sauce 4-1 gallon Claude's $38.68 Ben E. Keith 660015 1

67 Club Crackers, Gold 2 Portion pac 400ct Lance $21.39 Labatt 3770073 6

68 Cobbler Sheets Dough Frozen  24/1 Lb $16.24 Sysco 1865088 8

69 Coffee Classic Folgers Filtered Pouches 160-9oz Foldgers $16.09 Sysco 1151679 1

70 Concentrated Tea liquid 24 / 3oz Thrist-tea $53.08 Labatt 8332520 1

71 Cookie Dough Choc Chip Delicious Essentials 240ct Mfg. 55680 spunkmeyer $31.38 Sysco 7728403 2

72 Cookie Dough Macadamia Nut 240ct spunkmeyer $31.38 Sysco 7728466 2

73 Cookie Dough Oatmeal Delicious Essentials 240ct Mfg. 55683 spunkmeyer $35.02 Sysco 401411 2

74 Cookie Dough Sugar Delicious Essentials 240ct Mfg. 55684 spunkmeyer $15.18 Sysco 2094498 2

75 Corn Cut Frozen Kernels12/2 Lbs bags IQF $20.63 Sysco 3533486 14

76 Corn Dogs, Turkey Frank, Whole Grain, CN Labeled low sodium 48ct Foster Farm $35.02 Sysco 5275597 40

77 Corn On-the-Cob, IQF 96 ct $16.09 Sysco 1025162 18

78 Corn Tortillas White Corn 6 / 80 count mission $31.38 Sysco 7437724 20

79 Cornbread Mix, Home style 6/5 lbs $15.18 Sysco 2110803 4

80 Cornstarch 8-1 Lbs Boxes Argo $25.72 Labatt 35365 1

81 Cracker Bits Cheese indv wrapped 75ct Nabisco $20.71 Labatt 3731114 4

82 Cracker Bits Peanut Butter indv wrapped 48ct Ritz $23.17 Ben E. Keith 772063 4

83 Cracker Goldfish Cheese, Whole Grain, 150 -  1oz bags pepperedrige farms $31.38 Sysco 6599405 12

84 Crackers, Saltine - 2 pack - 500/case Regular Premium $17.11 Labatt 3770086 4

85 Cream Cheese PC. 14gm Units - 100ct Raskas $21.73 Labatt 8701724 23

86 Cream, individual -1,000/case Keith $24.29 Ben E. Keith 639322 1

87 Creamer, Coffee, French Vanilla 180 - 3/8 oz Nestle $16.25 Labatt 8261240 1

88 Croissants - 2 oz., sliced 48ct Whole Grain $31.38 Sysco 6423044 50

89 Croutons Garlic Herb - 10# box $20.63 Sysco 2622504 1

90 Cumin powder, 5 lb tub WT Season $26.67 Ben E. Keith 774352 1

91 Delight Breakfast Bar 128ct  Strawberry code 09823 FieldStone $53.61 Ben E. Keith 160474 18

92 Delight Breakfast Bar 128ct Apple code 09825 FieldStone $16.09 Sysco 848907 18

93 Dressing, French 100/1.5 oz Low Fat Portion cup only Ken's $14.45 Labatt 3479801 1

94 Dressing, Italian 100/1.5 oz Low Fat  Portion cup only Ken's $14.45 Labatt 3479801 1

95 Dressing, Ranch 100/1.5 oz Low Fat Portion cup only Ken's $14.45 Labatt 3478903 20

96 Dressing, Thousand Island, 100/1.5 oz Low Fat portion cup only Ellingotn $16.77 Ben E. Keith 164879 1

97 Egg Grilled Pattie Round 369ct - 1.5oz sunny fresh $20.63 Sysco 3984396 14

98 Egg Stravaganza, Bacon and Cheese Fully Cooked 4-5 Lbs sunny fresh $86.21 Ben E. Keith 145534 4

99 Egg, hard cooked or boiled 12/12 ct Mfg. 46025-85018 sunny fresh $20.63 Sysco 3115532 2

100 Fajita seasoning - 1 lb tub Durkee $12.54 Labatt 6184105 2

101 Fish, Tilapia, Tortilla Crusted Fillet $16.09 Sysco 744203 8

102 Flour Enriched 4/10 lbs all purpose Gld Medal $20.16 Labatt 3823382 4

103 French Toast Cinnamon 100/2.9oz Whole Grain CN labeled Pappetti's $20.63 Sysco 2697682 23

104 Frito Lay - Munchies Kids Mix 1oz bag 105ct Frito lay NO BID 17

105 Frito Lay Baked Cheetos regular & Hot 64ct Frito lay $31.38 Sysco 6376297 4

106 Frito Lay Baked Lays Original 64ct Frito lay $31.38 Sysco 6725313 4

107 Frito Lay Baked Ruffles 64ct Frito lay $40.27 Ben E. Keith 649105 4

108 Frito Lay Funnyuns 64ct Frito lay $31.38 Sysco 6725061 4

109 Frito Lay Munchies 64ct Frito lay $44.92 Ben E. Keith 771760 4



110 Fritos 1 oz bag - 105ct Frito lay $31.38 Sysco 8083552 4

111 Fruit Bowl, Packed in 100% fruit Juice Mandarin Oranges 72ct- 4oz DOLE $16.24 Sysco 1878729 13

112 Fruit Cocktail Mixed, In Natural Juice, 6 #10cans Specify brand $35.02 Sysco 4989604 12

113 Fruit Cups, Packed in 100% fruit Juice Diced Peaches 72ct- 4oz DOLE $21.38 Labatt 326090 13

114 Fruit Cups, Packed in 100% fruit Juice Diced Pears 72ct- 4oz DOLE $21.37 Labatt 480147 13

115 Fruit Cups, Packed in 100% fruit Juice Mixed Fruit 72ct- 4oz DOLE $19.63 Labatt 326041 13

116 Fruit Snacks Made with real fruit juice 100ct Welch's $31.38 Sysco 7002932 10

117 Garlic & Herb Seasoning Salt-Free 1- Lbs tub durkee $14.74 Labatt 6187447 2

118 Garlic Parmessan Wing Sauce 4-1 Gallon $20.63 Sysco 3366998

119 Garlic, granulated 1 lb bottle Spice Classic $9.88 Ben E. Keith 774715 1

120 General Mills Trail Mix Fruit and Nut Bar 96ct Nature Valley $76.59 Labatt 3761238 12

121 General Mills Trail Mix Sweet & Salty 96ct Nature Valley $64.91 Labatt 42068 12

122 Granola bulk 4 / 50oz Kellogg's $50.53 Labatt 6585770 6

123 Gravy mix, Brown 6 / 14oz Shawnee $15.48 Labatt 3455691 5

124 Gravy mix, Peppered Wthie 6 / 24koz Shawnee $17.44 Labatt 3445696 5

125 Gravy mix, Pork 6 / 14oz Shawnee $15.16 Labatt 3445698

126 Gravy mix, Turkey 6 / 14oz Shawnee $17.79 Labatt 3445695 5

127 Ham, boneless, Deli, 2/ 15-18 lbs case 93% meat 7%fat per pound Hormel $3.37 Ben E. Keith 113769 12

128 Heavy Duty, Clear Frying, Oil, Crisco Pro 35lbs 64139 Crisco $31.38 Sysco 7626013 3

129 Honey-BBQ Wing Sauce 4-1 Gallon $31.38 Sysco 5856133 2

130 Hot Dog Franks, 2oz, 1/10 lbs turkey 8:1 low sodium Briarst $23.11 Labatt 8938276 23

131 Italian Blend Veggies IQF 12/2 Lbs Bags $16.24 Sysco 1474998 12

132 Jell-O, Cherry 6/4.5 lbs Jell-O brand or equal $20.63 Sysco 4010419 4

133 Jell-O, Lime 6/4.5 lbs Jell-O brand or equal $20.63 Sysco 4010476 4

134 Jell-O, Orange 6/4.5 lbs Jell-O brand or equal $20.63 Sysco 4010443 4

135 Jelly, assorted - 200 pc p/cs - 1 oz PPI $15.48 Ben E. Keith 159581 10

136 Juice Bar 100ct CN Label 100% Juice 4041 or 4040 minute maid NO BID 18

137 Juice Orange 100% 10oz plastic bottles $16.24 Sysco 1606490 20

138 Juice, apple, carton, Frozen 70/4oz suncup $13.59 Labatt 60303 20

139 Juice, Cherry Apple, carton, Frozen 70/4oz suncup $13.84 Labatt 60313 20

140 Juice, Fruit Medley, carton, Frozen 70/4oz suncup $14.50 Labatt 60308 20

141 Juice, grape, carton, Frozen 70/4oz suncup $15.84 Labatt 60305 20

142 Juice, orange, carton, Frozen 70/4oz suncup $16.24 Sysco 1211440 20

143 Juice, orange-pineapple, carton, Frozen 70/4oz suncup $15.18 Sysco 1908193 20

144 Kellogg's Crunch Mania Graham Snacks 100- 1.76oz Cinnamon Bun Kellogg's $24.49 Labatt 3760067 23

145 Kellogg's  Crunch Mania Graham Snacks 100- 1.76oz French Toast Kellogg's $35.98 Labatt 3760066 23

146 Kitchen Bouquet Browning Sauce 1 gal. Bouqet $7.64 Labatt 3634516 1

147 Malt-O-Meal Cereal bowl pack (Kid's Choice) 96ct Gen Mills $31.28 Labatt 6490003 25

148 Margarine Solids, 30 / 1 lb case Old World $30.44 Labatt 8143959 6

149 Margarine, PC 14g 500ct Golden Harvest $28.75 Ben E. Keith 148010 1

150 Marinara Sauce #10 Can "Red Gold" Red Gold $35.02 Sysco 4189361 12

151 Marshmallows, miniatures - 12/1# Jet Puff $17.16 Labatt 4741589 4

152 Mayonaise dressing 4/ 1 gal. $20.63 Sysco 4002432 1

153 Meat, Balls, Cooked and Seasoned Mfg. 7362-328 (1oz ea- 10 Lbs Case) advance/Pierre $31.38 Sysco 7771991 45

154 Mixed Vegetables 4-way blend, IQF 12/2 Lbs Bags $20.63 Sysco 3828577 14

155 Morning sausage roll, Whole Grain, CN Labeled 80- 2oz Le Chi $33.64 Labatt 8915600 30

156 Mozzarella string cheese 1oz - 168ct $35.02 Sysco 4384214 10

157 Muffin Apple Cinnamon IW Reduced Fat 1.8oz Otis 03745 WG- 72ct Otis Spunkmayer $15.18 Sysco 2354346 12

158 Muffin Banana IW Reduced Fat 1.8oz OtisSpunk 03705 WG- 72ct Dave's $34.53 Labatt 4039056 12

159 Muffin Blueberry IW Reduced Fat 1.8oz OtisSpunk  03700 WG -72ct Otis Spunkmayer $15.18 Sysco 2354359 12

160 Muffins English Multigrain Ready to serve splited 72ct $16.09 Sysco 1182120 32

161 Mustard, 500 individual, 9 gr. PPI $12.42 Labatt 3372224 4

162 Onions, dehydrated 15 lbs case $31.38 Sysco 7356639 1

163 Oven Ready Mozarella Sticks item #41009  -  113 per case@ 5 each Tasty Brands $66.07 Ben E. Keith 394795 35

164 Pace Picante Sauce 4/1 gallon "Medium" Pace $31.38 Sysco 7779814 4

165 Pan and Food Spray Buttermist  6/14 oz Mfg. 56240 Vegalene $23.12 Labatt 8037260 1

166 Pancake & Sausage Breakfast Stick Whole Grain Maple, 60ct Foster Farms $30.03 Labatt 9330018 39



167 Pasta Lasagna noodles 20 lbs ruffled Zeregas $18.26 Labatt 4189511 4

168 Pasta Macaroni, cut 20 Lbs Patria $22.53 Labatt 4152089 4

169 Pasta Noodles, Egg, medium 20 Lbs Zeregas $20.64 Labatt 4171815 4

170 Pasta Spaghetti, Noodle long  20# Patria $21.95 Labatt 4152106 4

171 PB & Jelly Sandwiches Whole Grain, IW 72ct per case Smuckers $31.38 Sysco 7150102 32

172 Peach Pie, Filling Sweet 6 #10 cans Tyson $20.63 Sysco 4010880 11

173 Peaches, diced in 100% fruit juice 6 #10 $20.63 Sysco 3980691 12

174 Peaches, sliced, in natural juice 6#10 cans $20.63 Sysco 3980691 12

175 Peanut Butter, creamy 6/5 Lbs plastic jars $31.38 Sysco 9732967 3

176 Pears, diced, in natural juice 6 #10 cans $20.63 Sysco 2537935 12

177 Peas & Carrots, Diced 12-2 Lbs Bags IQF $20.63 Sysco 3960093 12

178 Peas, green, Frozen, 12-2 Lbs Bags IQF $16.24 Sysco 1259530 12

179 Pecan pieces (small or medium) 5# box Vending $35.21 Labatt 4410008 1

180 Pepper, diced red, pimiento 24 #300 cans Dunbar $52.57 Ben E. Keith 685060 1

181 Pepper, diced, green, mild 24 #300 cans $31.38 Sysco 5882725 1

182 Pepper, Midget, individual 3000/pkg Diam Cryst $11.82 Labatt 6331243 1

183 Peppers, sliced, Jalapeño, plastic jars 4/1 Gallon Lacomadre $31.07 Labatt 1983141 1

184 Pickle, Chips 1/8" Crinkle Cut, Pouches, Grade A Heinz $35.02 Sysco 4089298 4

185 Pickles, Spears dill 4/1 Gallon jars $16.09 Sysco 1131960 10

186 Pickles, whole, dill 4 /1 Gallon jars $16.09 Sysco 1028901 6

187 Pineapple, crushed, in Natural Juice, 6 #10 cans $35.02 Sysco 4285839 4

188 Pineapple, sliced, in Natural Juice, 6  #10 cans $35.02 Sysco 4301958 14

189 Pineapple, tidbit, in Natural Juice 6  #10 cans $35.02 Sysco 4106498 14

190 Pizza Stixs 48-3oz Chef America "Hot Pockets" 05310  Nestle Chef Amer $29.07 Labatt 8901001 40

191 Pizza, Pepperoni, Round 60 / 5 inch CN Label Nardones $61.24 Labatt 8902370 30

192 Pop-Tarts, 120 cs Whole Grain. IW 38000-36657 Kellogg's $45.25 Labatt 9993579 20

193 Pork and beans 6  #10 cans Wagon MSTR $33.79 Labatt 1554224 14

194 Pork Boston Butt, Boneless USDA Grade, Raw per pound Smithfield $2.14 Labatt 8939365 5

195 Pork Chorizo Links10lbs case DSM Portk $3.44 Labatt 5450992 1

196 Pork Rib Grill Honey BBQ Ribblets 100ct product code 3717 advance/Pierre $42.47 Ben E. Keith 191505 20

197 Pork Roast Raw Netted  per pound $3.17 $532,181.00 532181 4

198 Pork Tamales 120ct 2oz #902  UPC 30078051902117 Rodriguez Foods $31.38 Sysco 7465145 30

199 Pork, Diced, 1/2" cubes 4/5 lbs case DSM Portk $2.95 Labatt 8911435 4

200 Potato Mashed Traditions Simplot 12 / 26oz Simplot $20.63 Sysco 3677739 8

201 Potato, breakfast, cubes 6/5lbs Seasoned Frozen lambweston $20.63 Sysco 3644036 5

202 Potatoes Au Gratin, Dehydrated, 12/20.35 oz. Simplot $35.02 Sysco 4703567 6

203 Potatoes Scalloped Dehydrated 12/20.35 oz Simplot $31.38 Sysco 7489378 6

204 Potatoes, Crinkle Cut 6/5 Lbs OVEN READY Simplot $31.38 Sysco 8897431 10

205 Potatoes, Savory Loops, Seasoned 6/5 Lbs Tater Pals $43.62 Labatt 8970068 20

206 Potatoes, Tater Tots 6/5Lbs Mfg. 004189 OVEN READY Simplot $35.02 Sysco 5246846 12

207 Potatoes, white, diced, small 6  #10 cans Allens $34.00 Labatt 1555213 2

208 Powdered milk - 25# bag $35.02 Sysco 5398946 1

209 Pudding, Banana 6 #10 cans Luck LF $23.58 Labatt 5020011 6

210 Pudding, Chocolate 6 # 10 cans GEHL's $46.30 Labatt 5041569 6

211 Pudding, Vanilla, 6 #10 cans $20.63 Sysco 4011078 6

212 Quaker Chewy 90 Calorie Granola Bars 12/10ct Quaker $34.21 Labatt 3760144 19

213 Quaker Chewy Reduced Sugar Granola Bars 12/10ct Quaker NO BID 19

214 Quaker Oatmeal Breakfast squares (Indv wrapped) 125ct Quaker NO BID 19

215 Red Pepper, Crushed 1 lb. Bottle McCormick $10.48 Ben E. Keith 774167 1

216 Relish, sweet  4/1 Gal. Best Maid $32.60 Labatt 5162360 1

217 Rice Krispi Squares "fat/low or sugar free" 48ct $31.38 Sysco 6878597 34

218 Rice, parboil, 25 Lbs case Golden Harvest $15.69 Ben E. Keith 122771 8

219 Rolled oats, 8/42 oz. Quaker $31.38 Sysco 8562621 1

220 Salad dressing, Ranch, 4-1gal p/cs $20.63 Sysco 4003679 1

221 Salt 25 lb bag Truflo $6.68 Ben E. Keith 159455 1

222 Salt, Midget, individual 3000/pkg Keith $10.58 Ben E. Keith 676007 1

223 Salt, seasoned 4/5 lbs durkee $11.51 Labatt 6191233 1



224 Sausage, fully cooked, Crumbles 10 lbs case Jimmy Dean $30.57 Ben E. Keith 549112 1

225 Sausage, Links, Skinless, Fully Cooked, 200/.8 oz, 10 lb Hormel $31.38 Sysco 7433659 12

226 Seasoning Spice Marjoram - 11oz durkee $6.15 Labatt 6184410 1

227 Seasoning Spice Nutmeg 1 lb tub durkee $14.21 Labatt 6184501 1

228 Seasoning Spice Onion powder 1 lb tub durkee $5.93 Labatt 6182208 1

229 Seasoning Spice Oregano, ground 1 lbs tub durkee $7.13 Labatt 6181226 1

230 Seasoning Spice Paprika, 26oz tub durkee $5.29 Ben E. Keith 774704 1

231 Seasoning, Garden, Salt-Free 26oz tub durkee NO BID 1

232 Seasoning, Herb Seasoning Durkee salt free  26oz tub durkee $14.74 Labatt 6187447 1

233 Soup, Cream of Chicken "Campbell's" 6-49.25oz # 5 can Campbell's $35.02 Sysco 4040325 9

234 Sour Cream, PC, 1.5oz cup 100ct Daisy $12.89 Ben E. Keith 669005 18

235 Soy Sauce La Choy 4/1 gallon La Choy $35.02 Sysco 5113907 1

236 Spice Pepper, black, 5#cans durkee $35.02 Sysco 5229356 1

237 Spicy Pepper Garlic Seasoning 26oz tub durkee $12.57 Labatt 6187777 1

238 Stew meat diced 1" cubed, 30% fat 4/5lbs DSM Beef $4.82 Labatt 5200135 16

239 Strawberries, sliced in juice - frozen - 6 / 5lbs $16.09 Sysco 1024363 5

240 Sugar, 1/6 individual 2000/case Keith $17.49 Ben E. Keith 675001 1

241 Sugar, brown #8 soft   25# $16.24 Sysco 1854694 1

242 Sugar, powdered, 50 lbs bag $16.24 Sysco 1854918 1

243 Sugar, white granulated  50# $35.02 Sysco 4782694 2

244 Sunflower Kernels Roasted Salted 3/2 lbs bag Ellington $22.77 Ben E. Keith 122577 5

245 Syrup, individual cups  100/1.5 oz. Mad Farms $14.98 Labatt 4655551 4

246 Taco sauce, 200 individual, 1/3 oz Poco Pac $9.01 Labatt 3292470 10

247 Taco Seasoning, Dry Mix Pouches 6-9oz bags Spice Classic $13.89 Ben E. Keith 660706 5

248 Taco shells, enriched  200 ct. Mex orig $13.38 Ben E. Keith 699063 25

249 Tomato Ketchup, 33% solid 6  #10 $20.63 Sysco 4005989 3

250 Tomato Ketchup, 500 individual, 9 gr. $21.77 Ben E. Keith 146968 20

251 Tomato Ketchup, Low Sodium, 6 /10 jug with pump $31.38 Sysco 9431024 5

252 Tomato paste, 26% solid 6  #10 $35.02 Sysco 4030664 1

253 Tomato Sauce #10 cans Ellington $29.19 Ben E. Keith 125658 1

254 Tomatoes, crushed 6  #10 cans $35.02 Sysco 4030599 1

255 Tomatoes, diced 6  #10 cans Ellington $26.29 Ben E. Keith 125654 2

256 Tomatoes, Whole 6  #10 cans Keith $24.47 Ben E. Keith 650432 1

257 Tony's 3.2X5 Breakfast Turkey Sausage 128 ct Tony's $53.72 Labatt 63912 20

258 Tortillas, Flour 6" Fresh not Frozen "Mission 24 - 12ct Rudy's $27.74 Labatt 8971585 12

259 Tortillas, Flour 8" Fresh not Frozen "Mission" 12 - 12ct mission $16.09 Sysco 961201 20

260 Tostadas Shell, Whole 5"  200 ct. Mex Orignl $17.80 Labatt 4335632 10

261 Turkey Breast, deli sliced, Honey Roasted Low Sodium SKU#5705 10 Lbs case $20.63 Sysco 2528636 10

262 Turkey Roast (white & dark meat) per pound $3.42/lb Ben E. Keith 171804 10

263 Turkey Sausage Pattie 1.25oz fully Cooked 128ct Jimmy Dean $26.72 Labatt 8928418 20

264 Vanilla extract, 12oz bottle McCormick $6.93 Ben E. Keith 777035 1

265 Vanilla Wafers 12/2 lbs $14.89 Ben E. Keith 772011 6

266 Vinegar, White, 4/1gl $10.88 Ben E. Keith 124167 4

267 Waffle Whole Grain, IW Maple 2.2oz Mfg. 33505 (72ct) $15.18 Sysco 2173365 32

268 WG Apple Cinnamon Crumble IW product 72ct code# 92236 Dave's $21.60 Labatt 4037800 32

269 WG Strawberri Fruity Pancake Bowl IW 72ct   code# 94040 Buena Vista $64.63 Labatt 5520057 32

270 Whipped topping Frozen Bag 12-16oz $16.09 Sysco 1169960 4

271 White corn syrup, 4/1 gal. $20.63 Sysco 3995034 3

272 Whole Wheat Gravy, Egg & Cheese Brekfast Pizza UPC# 8554113080 Tony's $55.38 Labatt 8901417 60

273 Whole Wheat Stuffed Crust Pepperoni Pizza 70ct item UPC# 8554112030 Nardones $61.40 Labatt 8902181 60

274 Worcestershire Sauce, 1 gal - 4 p/cs $20.63 Sysco 4007910 1

275 Yeast, Fleischmann's Dry, 12/2 lbs $83.35 Sysco 5779172 1

276 Zesty Orange Sauce Ready to Use 6 / 5.4 LBS Minor's $31.38 Sysco 933770 10


